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Birgitta Agerberth completed her PhD on 
bioactive peptides in 1993 at the 
Department of Biochemistry II, Karolinska 
Institutet. She performed her post-doc 
studies in Prof. Hans G. Bomans laboratory 
at the Department of Microbiology, 
University of Stockholm from 1993 to 1995. 
She was appointed as Associate Professor in 
Medical Biochemistry, Department of 
Medical Biochemistry and Biophysics, 
Karolinska Institutet in 1998. BA became a 
professor of Medical Microbial 
Pathogenesis, at the Department of MBB, 
Karolinska Institutet in 2008. 
 
She was one of the principle researchers in 
the discovery of the human antimicrobial 
peptide LL-37 of the cathelicidin family. 
She has also been involved in pioneering 
work on host microbe interaction, human 
infections and inflammatory diseases with 
respect to LL-37. BA has published 115 
original/review articles with a total citation 
of 7229. 
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